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Three Reminger Attorneys Selected to 2018-2019  
“Who’s Who in Toledo Area Law” List 

Laurie J. Avery, David R. Hudson, Taylor Knight Honored by Toledo Business Journal 
  

 

TOLEDO, OH – Reminger Co., LPA is pleased to announce that Laurie Avery, David Hudson, 
and Taylor Knight of our Toledo office were published in the Toledo Business Journal as part 
of their “Who’s Who in Area Law” list for 2018-2019.  
 
“Who’s Who in Area Law” is a regional list of outstanding attorneys who have attained a high 
degree of peer recognition and professional achievement. The selection process includes both 
peer nominations and client assessments. The “Who’s Who” list is an effort by the Toledo 
Business Journal to help identify the most credible, highly capable legal professionals 
practicing law in the area. 
 
Laurie J. Avery: Laurie has successfully defended numerous jury trials in matters ranging 
from employment discrimination, professional negligence, general tort and commercial 
disputes. She has also successfully defended numerous administrative charges of 
discrimination and labor arbitrations for local employers. Laurie represents professionals and 
businesses in a wide range of matters in both state and federal courts in Ohio and Michigan. 
She is a member of the firm's Management Group and serves as a Leader of the following 
groups: Employment Practices, Commercial Premises Liability, and Intellectual Property, 
Internet & Technology.  
 
Laurie is a frequent lecturer for Council on Education in Management on employment-related 
topics. She has presented at numerous continuing legal education seminars in the areas of 
commercial premises liability, employment law, professional liability and technology. Laurie 
has received multiple honors including the “20 under 40 Leadership Award” and being named 
a Super Lawyer by Ohio Super Lawyers Magazine. Laurie has received multiple honors 
including the “20 under 40 Leadership Award” and being named a Super Lawyer by Ohio 
Super Lawyers Magazine since 2014. Laurie serves on the Toledo Bar Association’s 
Grievance Committee. 
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David R. Hudson: David's practice is focused on civil defense litigation, including trucking and 
transportation claims, real estate title litigation, professional liability claims, employment law 
claims, D&O liability, and securities litigation. David has experience in defending complex tort 
litigation, class action disputes and catastrophic injury claims. He handles litigated claims for 
clients in state and federal courts in Ohio, Indiana and Michigan.  
 
David has been recognized as a Rising Star by Ohio Super Lawyers Magazine. He graduated 
from Wilmington College with a degree in criminal justice and a minor in accounting.  Prior to 
becoming a lawyer, David worked as a special investigator for the U.S. Office of Personnel 
Management, conducting national security background investigations in the Washington D.C. 
area.  In 2006, David returned to Ohio and graduated from the University of Toledo College of 
Law. 
 
Taylor Knight: Taylor focuses her legal practice in various areas, including medical 
malpractice, professional liability, oil, natural gas and energy, and D&O and employment 
practices. Since joining Reminger as a law clerk in 2010, she has gained experience in all 
aspects of litigation, including pleadings, motion practice, discovery, trial preparation and trial. 
 
Taylor has been recognized as a Rising Star by Ohio Super Lawyers Magazine. Taylor earned 
her Juris Doctorate from the University of Toledo in 2012, magna cum laude, where she 
received several honors for her high academic achievement and served as a teaching 
assistant to both Legal Research and Writing and Criminal Law courses. She also served as a 
judicial extern for the Honorable Judge David Katz of the Northern District of Ohio and as the 
chairman of the Trial Advocacy Team. 
 
Laurie can be reached by emailing lavery@reminger.com or by calling 419.254.1311. 
 
David can be reached by emailing dhudson@reminger.com or by calling 419.254.1311. 
 
Taylor can be reached by emailing tknight@reminger.com or by calling 419.609.4237. 
 
About Reminger, Attorneys at Law: 
Reminger Co., LPA is a full-service law firm with fourteen offices throughout the Midwest: 
Cleveland, Cincinnati, Columbus, Akron, Youngstown, Sandusky, Toledo, Fort Mitchell, 
Lexington, Louisville, Indianapolis, Fort Wayne, Northwest Indiana and Evansville. With more 
than 135 attorneys collectively, Reminger's practice areas include all aspects of litigation, 
along with corporate, tax, real estate and probate matters. Our fundamental objective in all the 
legal services we provide is to obtain the best possible results for our clients in the most 
practical and efficient manner possible. For more information, visit Reminger at 
www.reminger.com.  
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