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Gregory G. Guice Named to Lawyers of Color  
Inaugural Hot List  

 
 
CLEVELAND, OH - Reminger Co., LPA is pleased to announce that Lawyers of Color (LOC) recently named 
Gregory G. Guice as one of their 100 early-to-mid career minority attorneys under 40 from the Midwest Region to 
its Inaugural Hot List. LOC has been recognized by the American Bar Association, National Black Law Students 
Association, and National Association of Black Journalists. 
 
The honorees were chosen through a two-pronged process. The selection committee spent months reviewing 
nominations and researching bar publications and legal blogs in order to identify promising candidates. 
Nominations were accepted from mentors, peers and colleagues. Editorial picks were made based on the 
research of attorneys who had noteworthy accomplishments or were active in legal pipeline initiatives. 
 
Gregory represents hundreds of clients in the areas of commercial premises liability, retail/hospitality liability, 
professional liability, general tort liability, business/commercial litigation and employment liability. Gregory's 
litigation experience includes various state and appellate courts throughout Ohio, as well as federal and 
bankruptcy courts. 
 
Gregory is currently the chair of the firm's Retail & Hospitality Group and the firm's Diversity Committee. He is a 
member of numerous and various professional bar associations, including the American Bar Association, National 
Bar Association, Ohio Bar Association, Norman S. Minor Bar Association and the Cleveland Metropolitan Bar 
Association. Gregory is a member of the Cleveland Metropolitan Bar Association's Board of Trustees, as well as 
the CMBA’s Finance and Diversity & Inclusion Committees. He is also the co-chair of the CMBA’s Minority 
Clerkship Program and was recently the Co-Chair of the CMBA’s Diversity & Inclusion Committee’s 2012 
Diversity Forum Program – “Promoting Diversity & Inclusion Through Pipeline Programs—A Tool Kit for Action.” 
In addition, he has been recognized repeatedly as a Rising Star in Ohio SuperLawyers Magazine. 
 
Gregory can be reached by emailing gguice@reminger.com or by calling 216-430-2227. 
 
About Reminger, Attorneys at Law: 
Reminger Co., L.P.A. is a full-service law firm with eleven offices throughout the Midwest: Cleveland, Cincinnati, 
Columbus, Akron, Youngstown, Sandusky, Toledo, Fort Mitchell, Lexington, Louisville and Indianapolis. With 
more than 125 attorneys collectively, Reminger's practice areas include all aspects of litigation, along with 
corporate, tax, real estate and probate matters. Our fundamental objective in all the legal services we provide is to 
obtain the best possible results for our clients in the most practical and efficient manner possible. For more 
information, visit Reminger at www.reminger.com.  
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