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Acacia Perko Named Co-Chair of Reminger Co., LPA’s 
Women’s Initiative 

 

CLEVELAND, OH – Reminger Co., LPA is pleased to announce that Acacia Perko has been named 
Co-Chair of our Women’s Initiative. Acacia joins Co-Chair Carrie Masters Starts in overseeing our 
committee that focuses on the recruitment, advancement, and retention of women attorneys.  

Established in 2008, the Reminger Women’s Initiative has created marketing and networking 
opportunities for the firm as well as initiated the Vanguard Award Gala, an event that recognizes 
outstanding women and their contributions to the community. In addition, the group holds “Mentor 
Mondays’ in conjunction with The Centers for Families and Children and El Barrio, helping prospective 
job candidates by conducting mock interviews and reviewing resumes. 

Acacia’s legal practice includes both litigation and transactional matters. On the litigation side, her 
practice involves general casualty insurance defense and medical malpractice defense. She defends 
hospitals and physicians in numerous specialties as well as skilled nursing and assisted living 
facilities. On the transactional side, her practice focuses on employment, business, and intellectual 
property matters for companies, including local craft breweries.  

Acacia is active in the legal community as a member of the Columbus Bar Association, the Ohio 
Women's Bar Association, and the Women Lawyers of Franklin County.  Acacia is an active rider with 
the United States Equestrian Federation. She is a former board member of My Sister’s Place, a 
501(c)(3) created to provide safe and sober housing for women in transition. Acacia is also a former co-
chair of 4word Columbus, the Columbus chapter of 4word, a national faith-based community designed 
to connect, lead and support professional women to achieve their potential.  

Acacia can be reached by calling 614.232.2628 or by emailing aperko@reminger.com 

About Reminger, Attorneys at Law: 

Reminger Co., L.P.A. is a full-service law firm with fourteen offices throughout the Midwest: Cleveland, 
Cincinnati, Columbus, Akron, Youngstown, Sandusky, Toledo, Fort Mitchell, Lexington, Louisville, 
Indianapolis, Fort Wayne, Northwest Indiana and Evansville. With more than 130 attorneys collectively, 
Reminger's practice areas include all aspects of litigation, along with corporate, tax, real estate and 
probate matters. Our fundamental objective in all the legal services we provide is to obtain the best 
possible results for our clients in the most practical and efficient manner possible. For more information, 
visit Reminger at www.reminger.com.  
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